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Trevor Gleeson’s inspirational story is one of remarkable 
achievement through the face of adversity and perseverance 
to reach the top of his profession.

Trevor described as a “passionate” coach, has coached the 
Perth Wildcats for the last seven years, whilst leading the 
Wildcats to 5 National Basketball League Titles, including 4 in 
the past 5 years. Trevor’s five championships are the second 
most in NBL history.  

When it comes to the fundamentals of effective leadership, 
managing and inspiring his players, there are great parallels 
of what Trevor does in professional sports to the world of 
business. This is attested to by the fact that many CEO’s seek 
Trevor’s counsel to speak to their executive teams. 

Trevor has spent over 20 years leading some of the highest 
performing athletes. He now transfers that vast experience 
to help businesses and organisations develop championship-
level performance and leadership, and how to build a ‘high 
performance culture’.

He shares his stories about an untimely tragedy as an 18-yr 
old, the perseverance needed to rise to the pinnacle of 
coaching and how he has sustained success at the elite level 
under the pressure of professional sport.

Trevor’s story is one of leadership, self-belief and overcoming 
adversity. He is one of the winningest coaches in Australian 
NBL history. He is a modern coach who is always innovative 
and re-inventing himself to be among the best in the business.
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